
IndiGo... 
“We want to plan ahead. Since 
there will be a steady induction 
of ATR-72 jets this year, we have 
to keep the pool of pilots 
ready,” a senior company exec-
utive said, adding that the com-
pany had given priority to 
those pilots who had got an 
offer to join the company in 
December 2019 but were not 
inducted due to the impact of 
Covid-19. The person said the 
company would prefer to hire 
Indian pilots rather than expats 
to bring down the salary bill. 

However, the airline is 
unlikely to restart hiring for the 
Airbus A320 family aircraft, 
which is the mainstay of its 
fleet. While IndiGo inducted 
around 44 aircraft in 2020 — 
the highest by any airline 
across the world — all of them 
were replaced as the airline was 
phasing out hundreds of older 
aircraft. “For the A320 aircraft, 
we don’t see any immediate 
requirement of pilots as the 
size of the fleet will remain the 
same,” the executive quoted 
earlier said. 

A spokesperson for IndiGo 
refused to comment on the 
company’s hiring plans. 

Pilots for ATR planes, espe-
cially commanders, are scarce 
because the plane maker has a 
limited market share in India. 
Besides IndiGo, it’s Truejet 
which operates seven ATR-72 
jets. India had announced 
nationwide lockdown in March 
last year in order to contain the 
spread of coronavirus, but the 
move led to a body blow for air-
lines as they stayed grounded 
for around two months. 
Airlines resorted to drastic pay-

cuts, sent employees on leave 
without pay, or even terminat-
ed employment contracts. 

According to data provided 
by the government in 
Parliament, the pandemic 
caused over 39,000 job losses 
in the Indian aviation sector 
last summer. 

According to an estimate by 
the Geneva-based Air Transport 
Action Group, the pandemic 
has cost around 4.8 million avi-
ation jobs, slashing global staff 
at airlines, manufacturers, air-
ports and air-traffic controllers 
by more than 40 per cent. 
IndiGo’s intent to rehire signals 
the overall improvement of sen-
timent of employability, said 
Rituparna Chakraborty, co-
founder and executive vice 
president at staffing firm 
TeamLease Services. “IndiGo 
must be sensing that the restric-
tions on travel will be gradually 
removed and people will travel 
more due to the pent-up 
demand,” she said. 

According to the company’s 
Employment Outlook Report 
for the third quarter, the intent 
to hire by companies has 
increased by 3 per cent. 

 

Twitter... 
The blog further added: 
“Because we do not believe that 
the actions we have been 
directed to take are consistent 
with Indian law, and, in keep-
ing with our principles of 
defending protected speech 
and freedom of expression, we 
have not taken any action on 
accounts that consist of news 
media entities, journalists, 
activists, and politicians. To do 
so, we believe, would violate 
their fundamental right to free 

expression under Indian law. 
We informed MeitY of our 
enforcement actions today, 
February 10, 2021. We will con-
tinue to maintain dialogue 
with the Indian government 
and respectfully engage with 
them,” Twitter said. 

A senior MeitY official said: 
“While we are extremely 
respectful of freedom of 
expression and love tools and 
technology that enable free 
expression ... disrespecting 
democratic values in India and 
infringing the law in the name 
of some rules that are drafted 
by a commercial enterprise 
(are) crossing the line.” 

The official added a private 
entity’s own rules could not be 
above the law of the land. 

Takedown notices were also 
sent to other social media plat-
forms like Facebook and 
YouTube but they complied 
with the requests, the official 
said. Twitter further said it had 
taken steps to reduce the visi-
bility of the hashtags contain-
ing harmful content. The 
measures included prohibiting 
them from trending on Twitter 
and appearing as recommend-
ed search terms. 

“We took a range of enforce-
ment actions — including per-
manent suspension in certain 
cases — against more than 500 
accounts escalated across all 
MeitY orders for clear viola-
tions of Twitter’s rules,” the 
blog stated. 

It further said it had with-
held a portion of the accounts 
identified in the blocking 
orders under its Country 
Withheld Content Policy, pre-
venting the content from being 
visible in India only. These will 
be visible outside the country. 

Twitter permanently sus-
pended the account of Donald 
Trump in his last days as US 
president after it was alleged 
that his tweets resulted in riots 
inside the US seat of its legisla-
tive branch the Capitol 
Building in January this year. 

On January 26 in Delhi, a 
Sikh religious flag was raised at 
the Red Fort as part of the 
ongoing farmers’ protests, 
largely led by Sikh farmers. 

“The situation was almost 
similar to Capitol Hill (riots) ... 
In the case of Capitol Hill, do 
you stand in a different place 
and in the case of the Red Fort 
do you stand in a different 
place?” questioned the govern-
ment official, alluding to 
Twitter’s content takedown 
policies. Twitter said in its blog 
that beginning “26 January 

2021, its global team provided 
24/7 coverage and took 
enforcement action judiciously 
and impartially on content, 
trends, tweets, and accounts 
that were in violation of the 
Twitter Rules”. As a fallout of 
these, some ministers and 
MeitY have moved to an Indian 
Twitter alternative called Koo, 
and have also urged people to 
get on the platform. 

In response to the blog, 
MeitY put out an interim state-
ment on its account on Koo: 
“Upon the request of Twitter 
seeking a meeting with the 
Govt., the Secretary IT was to 
engage with senior manage-
ment of Twitter. In this light a 
blog post published prior to 
this engagement is unusual. 
The government will share its 
response soon,” it said. 

 

Poonawalla... 
Sanjay Chamria, vice-chair-
man and managing director of 
MFL, said the firm had 300 
branches with 10,000 employ-
ees, spread over 22 states. With 
the proposed capital infusion, 
the company expects improve-
ment in productivity and oper-
ating matrix. Existing promot-
ers will infuse ~250 crore and 
the Poonawallas will bring in 
about ~3,200 crore as capital. 

Subsequent to the comple-
tion of the preferential allot-
ment, the existing financial 
services business of 
Poonawalla Finance is pro-
posed to be consolidated into 
Magma Fincorp subject to 
compliance with extant regu-
lations. Adar Poonawalla will 
become the chairman of the 
board of directors, and Abhay 
Bhutada will become manag-
ing director. Chamria will con-
tinue as the executive vice-
chairman. 

The management team will 
be further strengthened 
through the appointment of a 
professional CEO & COO from 
among the best in the industry, 
with substantial experience of 
running large financial servic-
es’ businesses, they said. 

The acquisition of a control-
ling stake along with huge cap-
ital infusion is expected to have 
a positive impact on the busi-
ness operations, including for 
customers, employees, lenders 
and other stakeholders. 

Post transaction, MFL will 
be able to leverage the vast 
opportunities in the lending 
space with expected reduction 
in borrowing cost. 

Welcome India’s emergence 
as leading global power: US
LALIT K JHA 
Washington, 10 February  

Describing India as one 
of the most important 
partners of the US in 

the Indo-Pacific region, the 
Biden administration on 
Tuesday said that it wel-
comes India’s emergence as a 
leading global power and its 
role as a net security provider 
in the region. 

“India is one of the most 
important partners in the Indo-
Pacific region to us. We wel-
come India’s emergence as a 
leading global power and its 
role as a net security provider 
in the region,” State 
Department Spokesperson 
Ned Price told reporters at his 
daily news conference. 

Earlier in the day, he said, 
Secretary of State Tony 
Blinken spoke with his Indian 
counterpart, External Affairs 
Minister S Jaishankar, for the 
second time in less than a fort-
night. During the call, the two 
leaders reaffirmed the strength 
of the US-India partnership 
and discussed issues of mutual 
concern, including the situa-
tion in Myanmar. 

Blinken expressed concern 
over the military coup and the 
importance of rule of law and 
the democratic process in 
Myanmar. They also discussed 
regional developments, includ-
ing the value of US-India coop-

eration across the Indo-Pacific. 
“Both sides look forward to 
expanded regional coopera-
tion, including through the 
Quad, and to address the chal-
lenges of Covid and climate 
change,” Price said.  

Responding to a question, 
Price said the US-India 
Comprehensive Global 
Strategic Partnership is both 
broad as well as multi-faceted. 

“We’ll continue to engage at 
the highest levels of our gov-
ernment to deepen coopera-
tion on many fronts, and we are 
confident that the strong and 
upward trajectory of our part-
nership will, in fact, continue,” 
he told reporters. 

India and the US, he said, 

cooperate on a wide range of 
diplomatic and security issues, 
including defence, nonprolif-
eration, regional cooperation 
in the Indo-Pacific, counterter-
rorism, peacekeeping, the envi-
ronment, health, education, 
technology, agriculture, space 
and oceans. 

“We also work closely in 
international organisations, 
and we welcome India joining 
the Security Council in last 
month of this year for a two-
year term,” Price said. 

The United States, he not-
ed, also remains India’s 
largest and most important 
trading partner, with total 
bilateral trade increasing to 
$146 billion in 2019. PTI 
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Calls the country one of the most important partners in Indo-Pacific region

Disengagement of troops has begun in Ladakh: China
PRESS TRUST OF INDIA 
Beijing, 10 February 

The frontline troops of China 
and India at the south and 
north banks of the Pangong 
Lake in eastern Ladakh started 
synchronised and organised 
disengagement from 
Wednesday, the Chinese 
Defence ministry spokesper-
son announced. 

There was no comment 
from the Indian side on the 
statement made by the 
Chinese defence ministry 
spokesperson Colonel Wu 
Qian, and carried by China’s 
official media. 

According to the consensus 
reached by the 9th round of the 
Commander-level talks 
between China and India, the 
frontline units of the Chinese 

and Indian armed forces began 
organised disengagement from 
North and South banks of the 
Pangong Lake from February 
10, Wu said in a press release. 

“Chinese and Indian front-
line troops on the northern and 
southern banks of Pangong 
Lake began to disengage syn-
chronously in a planned man-
ner,” Wu said. 

The militaries of China and 

India have been engaged in a 
tense standoff in Ladakh since  
May last year. The two coun-
tries have held several rounds 
of military and diplomatic-lev-
el talks to resolve the face-off. 

On January 24, the 9th 
round of China-India Corps 
Commander-level meeting  
was held on the Chinese side 
of the Moldo-Chushul border  
meeting point.
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MUMBAI  |  THURSDAY, 11 FEBRUARY 2021

The US is closely monitoring the 
situation along the India-
China border, a senior official 
said on Tuesday and expressed 
concerns over Beijing's  
pattern of attempts to 
intimidate its neighbours. 

“We note the ongoing talks 
between the governments of 
India and China, and we 
continue to support direct 
dialogue and a peaceful 
resolution of those border 
disputes,” State Department 
Spokesperson Ned Price told 
reporters. Indian and Chinese 
troops have been locked in a 
bitter border standoff in 
Ladakh since May last year. 

Responding to questions, 
Price said, “We are concerned 
by Beijing's pattern of ongoing 
attempts to intimidate its 
neighbours. As always, we'll 
stand with friends, we'll stand 
with partners, we'll stand with 
allies to advance our shared 
prosperity, security, and values 
in, in this case, the Indo-
Pacific.” The spokesperson also 
said the US regularly engages 
with the Indian government on 
the two countries' shared 
commitment to democratic 
values. PTI 

We stand with 
friends: US on 
India-China row

The US remains India’s largest and most important trading 
partner, with bilateral trade increasing to $146 billion in 2019, 
said State Department spokesperson Ned Price 

> FROM PAGE 1



2/11/2021 11-02-2021 : Jhalawar Bhaskar ePaper: Read Jhalawar Bhaskar Local Hindi Newspaper Online,Page 4

https://epaper.bhaskar.com/jhalawar/jhalawar-bhaskar/427/11022021/0/3/ 1/1

Jhalawar  Jhalawar Bhaskar

1 2 3 4

     

javascript:void(0);
javascript:void(0);
javascript:void(0);
https://epaper.bhaskar.com/jhalawar/96/11022021/0/0/
https://epaper.bhaskar.com/jhalawar/jhalawar-bhaskar/427/11022021/0/0/
https://epaper.bhaskar.com/jhalawar/jhalawar-bhaskar/427/11022021/0/2/
https://epaper.bhaskar.com/jhalawar/jhalawar-bhaskar/427/11022021/0/1/
https://epaper.bhaskar.com/jhalawar/jhalawar-bhaskar/427/11022021/0/2/
https://epaper.bhaskar.com/jhalawar/jhalawar-bhaskar/427/11022021/0/3/
https://epaper.bhaskar.com/jhalawar/jhalawar-bhaskar/427/11022021/0/4/
https://epaper.bhaskar.com/jhalawar/jhalawar-bhaskar/427/11022021/0/4/
https://epaper.bhaskar.com/jhalawar/jhalawar-bhaskar/427/11022021/0/2/
https://epaper.bhaskar.com/jhalawar/jhalawar-bhaskar/427/11022021/0/4/

